RESOLUTION
BOROUGH OF PEAPACK & GLADSTONE, SOMERSET COUNTY, NEW JERSEY
RESOLUTION NO. 109-24
TITLE: AWARD OF BID FOR THE COLLECTION OF SOLID & BULK WASTE TO INTERSTATE WASTE
SERVICES FOR THE CONTRACT TERM OF THREE YEARS BEGINNING JULY 1, 2024 THROUGH JUNE
30, 2027

WHEREAS, the Borough of Peapack & Gladstone received the following bid on
Wednesday, May 5, 2024 at 10:00am for the collection of solid and bulk waste; and

Manual Collection Automatic Collection
Interstate Waste Services  1%year $126,781.00 No Bid
300 Frank W. Burr Blvd 2™ year $133,120.20 No Bid
Teaneck, NJ 07666 3"dyear $139,776.00 No Bid

Total $399,676.00
Cost of Disposal $88.00/ton (inclusive of $3.00 recycling surcharge)

Republic Services of NJ, LLC 1year No Bid $184,470.00
2" year No Bid $193,693.56
3 year No Bid $203,378.04
Total $581,541.60

Cost of Disposal $98.80/ton

LMR Disposal 1%t year $274,000.00 $303,333.00
2" year $276,000.00 $303,333.00
3 year $278,000.00 $303,000.00
Total $828,000.00 $909,999.00

Cost of Disposal $85.00/ton

WHEREAS, the Borough Attorney reviewed all documents submitted and found them to
be satisfactory and it is the recommendation of the Borough Administrator to award the contract
to Interstate Waste Services, 300 Frank Burr Blvd., Teaneck, NJ 07666, in the amount of
$399,676.00; and

WHEREAS, a certification affirming the availability of funds in accordance with N.J.A.C.
5:34-5.1 et seq. has been provided by the Chief Financial Officer and is attached hereto and made
a part hereof, indicating that the appropriation for the within expenditure is to be funded from
the 2024 Budget Current Account.



NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Mayor and Council of the Borough of Peapack
& Gladstone, County of Somerset, State of New Jersey that the contract be awarded to Interstate
Waste Services, 300 Frank Burr Blvd., Teaneck, NJ 07666, in the amount of $399,676.00 in
accordance with the terms of the contract.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that the Mayor and Borough Clerk are hereby authorized to
sign any and all documents for said contract.

Introduced | Seconded | Borough Council Aye Nay Abstain | Absent

Jamie Murphy

X Eric L. Quartello

Sergio Silva

X Julie M. Sueta

X | X|X|X|Xx

John Sweeney

Jill Weible X

IT IS HEREBY CERTIFIED THAT THE FOREGOING IS A TRUE AND CORRECT COPY OF A RESOLUTION
ADOPTED BY THE BOROUGH COUNCIL OF THE BOROUGH OF PEAPACK & GLADSTONE AT A MEETING

OF SAID COUNCIL HELD ON JUNE 6, 2024.
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I'NANCY A. BRETZGER/- MARK'A. CORIGLIANO
BOROUGH CLERK . MAYOR



FINANCE CERTIFICATION

I, Olu Ochei, CFO of the Borough of Peapack & Gladstone hereby certify that there are adequate
funds available for the above-named contract. Monies are available in the Operating Budget.

Olu Ochei, CFO



